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About Us
Safe and Sound Fire Limited put

customer needs at the center of

everything we do. We will strive to

deliver our promises and exceed

customer expectations by providing

what they want, when they want it and

in perfect condition. Our people are at

the heart of our business, giving us a

more competitive edge as Fire

Protection Engineers and Consultants.

We encourage and support each

individual development and value each

person’s contribution.



We are a dependable and trustworthy
family run company. Our friendly

experienced engineers are highly skilled
and have over 40 years of experience in

burglar alarm installations, burglar alarm
repairs and burglar alarm servicing with

all different types of alarm systems
across Glasgow, Edinburgh & surrounding
areas. Safe & Sound Fire LTD provides a
range of high quality alarm systems to

homes, local businesses and commercial
establishments in Glasgow, Edinburgh

and other surrounding regions. 

Intruder Alarm Systems



Camera Type: CCTV cameras come in
various styles, such as dome, bullet, and
PTZ (pan-tilt-zoom) cameras. Each type
has its own benefits and applications, so

consider your specific needs when choosing
a camera style.Image Quality: High-

resolution cameras provide clearer images,
making identifying intruders and other

details easier. Consider the importance of
image quality when selecting a CCTV

system.Night Vision: Many CCTV cameras
now offer night vision capabilities, ensuring
your property is monitored effectively even

in low-light conditions.

CCTV Systems 



Fire Extinguishers
Service 

Safe and Sound Fire Limited:

Service costs include all

consumable service parts such as

Safety pins, Safety clips, `O’-

Rings, Chubb OK indicators, Gauge

tests, labels, Anti-tamper seals,

CO2 swivel horns, CO2 hose, and

horns for standard UK portable

Fire Extinguishers.



Quality Access
Control Solutions

We work with industry-leaders in supplying
and installing access control systems. We

are also an NSI (National Security
Inspectorate) Gold approved installer,

meaning you can be assured of the very
highest standards and professionalism.
Couple all of this with guarantee your

security needs are in safe hands. Access
control systems are easy to configure and
manageYour teams can forget about the

hassle associated with traditional keysYou
can set specific access times and dates with

an access control system.



Contact Us

Address:Unit 4, 17A Old Mill Park

Kirkintilloch Glasgow G66 1SS

Phone No:01417767763

Business Email:

admin@safeandsoundfireltd.co.uk

www.safeandsoundfireltd.co.uk 



THANK
YOU 


