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GROOMING




INTERNATIONAL ANIMAL CLINIC

The International Animal Clinic is a clinic
having years of practice in veterinary in
New York catering to dogs and cats. Our
services include physical and wellness
examinations, vaccinations, diet
consultations, and general and specialized
surgeries. We provide surgical
consultations (secondary opinions) for
surgical procedures performed at other
hospitals but our veterinarians can assist
with care. Animals of all ages are
welcome, including nursing mothers. For
the convenience of our patients and
clients, the clinic has a pharmacy stocked
with carefully selected health products. In
addition, we sell an assortment of Hill's
Prescription Diet pet food for both dogs
and cats. We accept walk-in patients
during the hours of operation but
scheduling an appointment is highly
suggested. We focus on the health and
well-being of your pets. We hope that our
commitment to providing high-quality
veterinary services at affordable prices
encourages pet owners to choose our
practice for all their health care needs. 

OUR SERVICES

CONNECT NOW
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